
 

2021 Pétillant Naturel Pinot Noir 

 
Vintage Notes 
The Pacific Northwest experienced a relatively warm winter during 2020-2021, and much of 
the Willamette valley saw average to below average winter precipitation. With a cool and dry 
start to the growing season, we saw budbreak the third week of April and progressed through 
a few heat spikes and then onto some cool weather in late May, and rain during flowering in 
June. The most memorable weather event of 2021 was the epic “heat dome” in late June, which 
fortunately did not damage the vines or developing berries thanks to the timing of the event 
and corresponding plant growth stage. The remainder of the growing season was warmer 
than average, with a cool down in both August and during harvest in October. In comparison 
to 2020, fruit set was consistent but yielded smaller clusters and berries overall. 2021 was a 
wonderful growing season, with low disease pressure, average yields and perfect clusters - 
which led to concentrated, fresh and complex wines across all clones and varieties at Johan. 
 
Production Notes 
Pétillant Naturel is a method of producing sparkling wine, also referred to as “Methode 
Ancestrale”, where the carbonation occurs from bottling the wine during the primary, 
alcoholic fermentation – in order to capture the carbon dioxide that is being naturally 
released. This sparkling rosé was made from all estate-grown, Demeter certified Biodynamic® 
Pinot Noir grapes. We farm Block 3, a small northwest facing section of the vineyard planted 
to clone 667, specifically for this wine.  We strive to achieve ripe fruit flavors and higher 
acidity, for a fresh and juicy expression of Pinot Noir. After 24 hours of skin contact, the 
grapes were pressed and fermented in a stainless steel tank before it was bottled at the tail 
end of its primary fermentation. Bottled unfiltered and contains lees – pour off slowly or 
invert to evenly distribute. 
 
 
Production: 549 cases produced  
Alcohol: 13.2% 
pH: 3.34 
TA: 6.3 g/L 


